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3 Annexes 

3.1 Annex I 

Summary of questions  

 

Q1. Do you agree with the proposed characteristics of suspension of subscriptions, 
repurchases and redemptions? If not, please justify your position. 
 
Q2. Do you agree that orders that have been placed but not executed before the fund 
manager suspends shall not be executed until the suspension is lifted? If not, please 
explain why these orders shall be executed. 
 
Q3. Once the fund is reopened for subscriptions, repurchases and redemptions, what 
would be your approach to redemption orders that have not been executed before the 
fund was suspended? 
 
Q4. Do you think there are circumstances where subscriptions, repurchases and 
redemptions may not be reopened simultaneously? If yes, what are these 
circumstances? 
 
Q5. Can you think of any further characteristics of suspension of subscriptions, 
repurchases and redemptions? 
 
Q6. Do you think there is merit for the characteristics of suspension of subscriptions, 
repurchases and redemptions gates to differ between different investment strategies 
and between AIFs and UCITS? If yes, how? 
 
Q7. Do you agree with the description of redemption gates and their characteristics? If 
not, please justify your position. 
 
Q8. The draft RTS provides that the redemption gate threshold shall be expressed as a 
percentage of the NAV of the fund considering the net redemption orders for a given 
dealing day. Are you aware of any other method that ESMA should consider in the RTS? 
If yes, please explain.  
 
Q9. Do you agree that redemption gates may be either activated automatically when the 
activation threshold is exceeded or that the fund manager/ fund Boards may decide 
whether or not to activate the redemption gate? Do you believe that automatic activation 
of redemption gates could create a first mover advantage? 
 
Q10. Do you think that the automatic activation of redemption gates shall not be 
permitted for some types of funds. If yes, please explain your position. 
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Q11. Do you agree that the activation threshold shall not be expressed at the level of 
the single redemption order? If not, please justify your position. 
 
Q12. In the case of activation of redemption gates, do you agree that investors should 
have the right to cancel the non-executed part of their redemption orders? In particular, 
should there be a different approach between UCITS and AIFs? 
 
Q13. Do you think there is merit in having different characteristics of redemption gates 
for different investment strategies and between AIFs and UCITS? If yes, how? 
 
Q14. In the case of funds with multiple share classes, do you agree that the same 
redemption gate shall apply to all share classes? If not, please justify your position. 
 
Q15. Can you think of any further characteristics of redemption gates? 
 
Q16. Do you agree with the description of extensions of notice period and their 
characteristics? If not, please justify your position. 
 
Q17. Do you agree that the same extension of notice period shall apply to all investors 
or different extensions of notice periods per share class/unit shall be allowed? Please 
justify your position. 
 
Q18. Do you agree that extensions of notice period may be applied for a pre-defined 
period of time (for a pre-defined number of dealing dates)? If not, please justify your 
position. 
 
Q19. Do you think there is merit for the characteristics of extensions of notice period to 
differ between different investment strategies and between AIFs and UCITS? If yes, 
how? 
 
Q20. How would you execute redemption orders that have been placed but not executed 
before the notice period is extended? Would you execute them under the original notice 
period, or would you execute them at the following dealing day?  
 
Q21. How would you ensure fair treatment of investors when deactivating the extension 
of notice period? 
 
Q22.Do you agree with the description of redemption fees and the corresponding 
characteristics? If not, please justify your position. 
 
Q23.Can you think of any other redemption fee mechanism than the ones described 
above? If yes, please provide examples. 
 
Q24. Do you think there is merit for the characteristics of redemption fees to differ 
between different investment strategies and between AIFs and UCITS? If yes, how? 
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Q25. Do you agree with the description of swing pricing and the corresponding 
characteristics? If not, please justify your position. 
 
Q26. Can you think of any characteristics of swing pricing that the ones described 
above? 
 
Q27. Do you think there is merit for the characteristics of swing pricing to differ between 
different investment strategies and between AIFs and UCITS? If yes, how? 
 
Q28. Do you agree that in the case of funds with multiple share classes, the same swing 
factor shall be applied to all share classes? If not, please justify your position. 
 
Q29. Do you agree with the description of the dual pricing and the corresponding 
characteristics? If not, please justify your position. 
 
Q30. Are there any other calculation methods for dual pricing that should be 
considered? If yes, please give example. 
 
Q31. Do you think there is merit for the characteristics of dual pricing to differ between 
different investment strategies and between AIFs and UCITS? If yes, how? 
 
Q32. Do you agree with the description of the anti-dilution levy and the corresponding 
characteristics? If not, please justify your position. 
 
Q33. Are there any other calculation methods for anti-dilution levy that ESMA shall 
consider? If yes, please give example. 
 
Q34. In the case of funds with multiple share classes, would you see the possibility for 
different anti-dilution levies depending on share classes? Please justify your position. 
 
Q35. Do you think there is merit for the characteristics of anti-dilution levy to differ 
between different investment strategies and between AIFs and UCITS? If yes, how? 
 
Q36. Do you agree with the description of redemptions in kind and the corresponding 
characteristics? If not, please justify your position. 
 
Q37. Can you think of any characteristics of redemptions in kind? 
 
Q38. Do you think there is merit for the characteristics of redemption in kinds to differ 
between different investment strategies between AIFs and UCITS? If yes, how? 
 
Q39. Do you agree with the description of side pockets and the corresponding 
characteristics? If not, please justify your position.  
 
Q40. Do you agree that in the case of UCITS, side pockets created by physical 
separation should only be done with the creation of a new UCITS where the assets for 
which there are no problems are placed? If not, please explain your position.   
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Q41. Can you think of any other characteristics of side pockets that ESMA should 
consider? In particular, do you think that the characteristics of side pockets shall differ 
between UCITS and AIFs (in addition to the creation of side pockets via physical 
separation of the assets)? If, yes please elaborate. 
 
Q42. Do you see merit in specifying further the characteristics that side pocket created 
by means of accounting segregation should have? If yes, can you please explain how 
you have created side pocket via accounting segregation? Have you encountered any 
legal constraints or are you aware of any legal constraints in your jurisdiction that may 
limit the use of side pockets via asset segregation? 
 
Q43: Do you agree that the assets in the side pocket should always be managed with 
the view to liquidate them? Or could there be circumstances, where a reintegration with 
the normal assets could be contemplated? Please explain.   
 
Q44. Do you agree with the above-mentioned reasoning in relation to the possible costs 

and benefits of the option taken by ESMA as regards the characteristics of LMTs set out 

in Annex IIA of the UCITS Directive? Which other types of costs or benefits would you 

consider in that context? 

Q45. Is there any ESG and innovation-related aspects that ESMA should consider when 

drafting the RTS under the UCITS Directive? 

Q46. Do you agree with the above-mentioned reasoning in relation to the possible costs 

and benefits of the option taken by ESMA as regards the characteristics of LMTs set out 

in Annex V of the AIFMD? Which other types of costs or benefits would you consider in 

that context? 

Q47. Is there any ESG and innovation-related aspects that ESMA should consider when 

drafting the RTS under the AIFMD? 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  




